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This	
  document	
  serves	
  as	
  a	
  final	
  report	
  on	
  my	
  work	
  as	
  the	
  Research	
  Assistant	
  for	
  the	
  
Commodifications	
  of	
  the	
  Past?	
  Working	
  Group	
  from	
  September	
  to	
  October	
  2010.	
  	
  	
  
	
  
Goals	
  

• Search	
  the	
  Knowledge	
  Base	
  for	
  records	
  applicable	
  to	
  this	
  working	
  group,	
  and	
  
complete	
  the	
  descriptions	
  for	
  each.	
  

• Add	
  new	
  records	
  and	
  relate	
  relevant	
  records.	
  
 
	
  
Product	
  
 
As of September 2010 the IPinCH Knowledge Base contained 208 publications (articles, 
letters, websites, webpages, government documents, and books) that related to the 
Commodifications of the Past Working Group. In the last 2 months I have read and 
analyzed these documents, completing the IPinCH descriptions for each.  From this I 
outlined some organizational themes that I included in my interim report. I then focused 
on collecting scholarly articles and news reports on themes that had fewer examples in 
the Knowledge Base. From this research I added 18 articles, and completed their IPinCH 
descriptions. I have also identified many more objects, accessible through both Google 
News and Google Scholar searches.  Finally, I have included examples of such searches 
as a starting point for the next Research Assistant.  
 
 
Current Themes:  
	
  
	
   In	
  reading	
  and	
  analyzing	
  the	
  Knowledge	
  Base	
  objects	
  I	
  can	
  suggest	
  a	
  few	
  
selected	
  themes	
  within	
  the	
  related	
  Commodifications	
  of	
  the	
  Past	
  working	
  group	
  
objects.	
  I	
  have	
  provided	
  a	
  list	
  of	
  these,	
  as	
  I	
  understand	
  them,	
  and	
  suggest	
  that	
  these	
  
represent	
  interesting	
  areas	
  of	
  focus	
  for	
  future	
  research.	
  In	
  some	
  cases	
  the	
  themes	
  
are	
  broad	
  and	
  cover	
  many	
  different	
  examples	
  while	
  others	
  are	
  more	
  narrowly	
  
focused-­‐	
  ones	
  that	
  do	
  not	
  easily	
  fall	
  into	
  the	
  broader	
  themes.	
  
 

1. The use of the use of Archaeological and/or Indigenous imagery in advertising 
and branding 

 
 The use of traditional Indigenous imagery in advertising and branding is a 
common theme in all types of commercial products. The Knowledge Base contains 
examples of  numerous examples, from small souvenir items to large national brands. 
This theme encapsulates a large number of subjects, including but not limited to: alcohol 
and tobacco marketing, government oversight, the use of indigenous imagery in state 
symbols, and the use of Indigenous and or archaeological heritage in tourism 
advertisements.    

 
KB entries: 45, 85, 112, 214, 295, 305, 311, 312, 322, 324, 384, 470, 471, 473, 480, 481, 
483, 701, 836, 925, 949, 1286, 1291, 1307, 1474, 1475, 1476, 1477, 1478, 1480, 1485 
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Links to useful Google searches: 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&q=marketing+%2B+%22Indigenous%22+%2B
+imagery&btnG=Search&as_sdt=2000&as_ylo=&as_vis=0  
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&q=Branding+%2B+Aboriginal+%2B+Advertis
ements+&btnG=Search&as_sdt=2000&as_ylo=&as_vis=0 
 

2. The commodification of traditional artistic expression: 
  
Traditional artistic expression refers to dance, art, songs and stories. The Knowledge 
Base contains fewer examples of these then the outright use of imagery in 
advertisements and branding. Examples of commodification of tradition dance includes 
the popularity of the Maori moko or the Hawaiian hulu. Stories and songs have been 
recorded and produced in books and audio visual and are sold by private companies, and 
the increasing demand for Indigenous art of all kind is widely documented. 

 
KB entries: 71, 87,  91, 81, 100, 120, 122, 185, 209, 301, 365, 369, 395, 413, 463, 674, 
693, 854, 876, 916, 977,  1028, 1090, 1203, 1523, 1524, 1588,  
 
Links to useful Google Searches: 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&as_sdt=2000&q=Traditional+Dance+and+Com
modification 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&as_sdt=2000&q=Indigenous+or+Aboriginal+%
2B+Art+%2B+%22Commodification%22+%2B%22+intellectual+Property%22 
 
 

3. 'For profit' genetic ancestry testing (Recreational Genetics) 
  
 The highly publicized Human Genome Project has resulted in a wide variety of 
private “for-profit” genetic testing companies. These companies promise genetic testing 
into both health and heritage. The promise of genetically tracing ancestry should provide 
an interesting focus for members of this working group. Advertisements tend to greatly 
overstate the accuracy and ability of the tests; promising to discover links to historic 
figures or to discover Native American ancestry. There are also reports of individuals 
attempting to use these test to claim benefits, scholarships, and other types of financial 
support. 
 
 KB entries: 203, 277, 436, 568, 1572, 1580,1582, 1583, 1584, 1586, 1587, 1589, 1592, 
1593, 1595, 1596 
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Links to useful Google searches: 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&as_sdt=2000&q=dna,+ancestry,+recreational+g
enetics 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&as_sdt=2000&q=DNA+tests,+genealogy,+priv
ate+company,+ancestry 
 
Google News: 
http://news.google.com/news?ie=utf8&oe=utf8&q=dna,+ancestry,+company&hl=en&gl
=us 
 
 

4. The private trade in antiquities 
 
  The looting of archaeological sites and the sale of artifacts continues to be a 
problem. However problems with looting and ownership over archaeological remains are 
not always cut-and-dry cases of theft. Instead there are numerous different issues at play, 
and anthropologists and archaeologists are  beginning to understand the complex roles 
that museums and archaeologist have to play in the antiquities trade. 
 
KB entries:  46, 64, 77, 280, 285, 308, 452, 591, 635, 637, 675, 683, 923,  1013, 1538 
 
Links to useful Google Searches: 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&q=Artefacts%20%2B%20looting&psj=1&um=
1&ie=UTF-8&sa=N&tab=ns 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&as_sdt=2000&q=Artefacts+%2B+collectors+%
2B+trade+%2B+Antiquities 
 
Google News: 
 
http://www.google.com/search?hl=en&q=DNA+tests,+genealogy,+private+company,+an
cestry&tbo=u&tbs=nws:1&source=og&sa=N&tab=sn#sclient=psy&hl=en&tbs=nws:1&
q=Artifacts+%2B+collectors+%2B+market+%2B+trade&aq=&aqi=&aql=&oq=&gs_rfai
=&psj=1&fp=dcbdd1be8eb8f40b 
 
http://www.google.com/search?hl=en&q=DNA+tests,+genealogy,+private+company,+an
cestry&tbo=u&tbs=nws:1&source=og&sa=N&tab=sn#sclient=psy&hl=en&tbs=nws:1&
q=Artefacts+%2B+looting&aq=f&aqi=&aql=&oq=&gs_rfai=&psj=1&fp=dcbdd1be8eb8
f40b 
 
 
 
 



	
   5	
  

 
5. The use of Traditional Cultural and Ecological Knowledge in New Products. 

 
  Tradition ecological knowledge is increasingly used  in new commercial products. 
Examples range from  new dietary supplements, alpaca farming in North America, and 
the popularity of 'traditional foods' in the western market. The use of traditional cultural 
knowledge is one that has been previously identified by the IPinCH team and as such the 
Knowledge Base houses numerous examples. Some useful examples that may need 
further investigation are the use of Hoodia and the compensation to the San of South 
Africa, 'fair-trade' farming especially in coffee and chocolate, as well as the use of 
'Ancient grains' in mass produced products. The use of traditional cultural knowledge in 
'New Age' products and practices is another under-explored area of research, and the 
relatively recent push by Indigenous groups to protect their traditional spiritual practices 
would be an interesting focus for future research. 
 
KB entries: 27, 43, 54, 123, 127, 134, 197, 211, 217, 218, 279, 311, 314, 333, 338, 352, 
357, 417, 588, 1029, 1209, 1518, 1585, 1597, 1591 
 
Links to useful Google Searches: 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&q=New+Age+%2B+Aboriginal+spirituality+%
2B+commercialization&btnG=Search&as_sdt=2000&as_ylo=&as_vis=0 
 
http://scholar.google.com/scholar?hl=en&q=Traditional+cultural+knowledge+%2B+mod
ern+use+%2B+profit&btnG=Search&as_sdt=2000&as_ylo=&as_vis=0 
 
 
Recommendations for future Research Assistants for the Commodifications of the 
Past? Working Group: 
 
1. Create a series of accurate and repeatable searches, in order to stay up-to-date on 
current issues in this field. Examples are listed for each of the above themes. 
 
2. Focus object collection on more scholarly and/or well publicized cases, rather than just 
collecting examples of commodification. Examples tend to be numerous and easily found, 
instead a focus on substantive cases will provide better cases for analysis.  
 
3. Identify a few selected cases without a robust academic analysis and focus high-level 
research and analysis on them, using previously studied cases as baselines. Some 
interesting examples might be the use of Indigenous Stories and Spiritual beliefs in 
modern “shaman' schools and books or the advertisements and future role of for-profit 
genetic testing in commercial ventures.  
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